
2/22/19 Natick Kennedy Middle School
Filed Sub - Bid Tabulation

Final Filed Bid Results
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-6 SUB BIDDER Base Bid
 Alt. #1 - PV 

Array 
Infrastructure 

 Alt. #2 - 
Underground 

Drainage 

 Total With 
Alternates Restriction  Actual Low Bid with 

Alts. Notes, Paragraph E

4 Masonry  $         961,500.00 
X X X X X Fernandes Masonry, Inc. $961,500  $                  -    $                 -    $          961,500.00 
X X X X X Marmelo Bros. Construction $1,064,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,064,000.00 
X X X X 5 Costa Brothers Masonry $1,071,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,071,000.00 
X X X X X Empire Masonry Corp. $1,090,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,090,000.00 
X X X X X Lighthouse Masonry, Inc. $1,113,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,113,000.00 
X X X X X Acranom Masonry, Inc. $1,242,510  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,242,510.00 

5 Miscellaneous Metals 1,835,000.00$       
X X X X X Roman Iron Works, Inc. $1,835,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,835,000.00 
X X X X X United Steel, Inc. $1,838,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,838,000.00 
X X X X X SMJ Metal Co., Inc. $1,975,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,975,000.00 
X X X X 5 Berlin Steel $2,086,420  $                  -    $                 -    $       2,086,420.00 
X X X X X V & G Iron Works, Inc. $2,189,898  $                  -    $                 -    $       2,189,898.00 

Quinn Bros. of Essex, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
7 Waterproofing Damproofing/Caulk 1,357,461.00$       

X X X X X
Superior Caulking & Waterproofing Co., 
Inc.

$1,357,461  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,357,461.00 

X X X X X
Folan Waterproofing & Construction Co., 
Inc.  

$1,410,390  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,410,390.00 

X X X X X Armani Restoration, Inc. $1,489,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,489,000.00 
X X X X X P.J Spillane Company, Inc. $1,816,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,816,000.00 

Beacon Waterproofing & Restoration No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
7 Roofing, Flashing and Sheet Metal 1,472,000.00$       

X X X X X Greenwood Industries, Inc. $1,472,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,472,000.00 

X X X X X Stanley Roofing Company, Inc. $1,472,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,472,000.00  Recover Green Roofs for Vegetated Roofs 
$134,260 

X X X X X Capeway Roofing $1,638,400  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,638,400.00 
X X X X X Titan Roofing, Inc. $1,662,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,662,000.00 

X X X X X J.D. Rivet & Co., Inc. $1,679,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,679,000.00  Weston Solutions for Vegetated Roof Covering 
$30,000 

X X X X X Silktown Roofing, Inc. $1,695,500  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,695,500.00 May be used by any general 
bidder except: CTA Construction

 Vivat Construction Sales for Metal Framed 
Skylight $33,829 

X X X X 5 Gibson Roofs, Inc. $2,144,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       2,144,000.00 
May be used by any general 
bidder except: Northern 
Contracting

X X X X X Feeley, McAnespie, Inc. $2,330,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       2,330,000.00  Recover Green Roofs for Vegetated Roof 
Covering $63,560 

John F. Shea Company, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
Rockwell Roofing, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
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8 Glass & Glazing 639,000.00$          
X X X X X Kapiloff's Glass, Inc. $639,000  $                  -    $                 -    $          639,000.00 
X X X X X Lockheed Window Corp. $794,000  $                  -    $                 -    $          794,000.00 

X X X X X Aluminum & Glass Concepts, Inc. $842,237  $                  -    $                 -    $          842,237.00 
 May be used by any general 
bidder except:
 H.V. Collins Company 

A & A Window Products, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
Chandler Architectural Products, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
GVW Incorporated No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
Lizotte Glass, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
R&R Window Contractors, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   

8 Metal Windows 3,218,000.00$       
X X X X X Lockheed Window Corp. $3,218,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,218,000.00 
X X X X X Chandler Architectural Products, Inc. $3,289,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,289,000.00 

X X X X X Kapiloff's Glass, Inc. $3,480,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,480,000.00 
X X X X X R&R Window Contractors, Inc. $3,606,979  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,606,979.00 
X X X X X Lizotte Glass, Inc. $3,797,100  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,797,100.00 
X X X X X GVW Incorporated $3,989,435  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,989,435.00 

A&A Window Products, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
9 Tile 938,480.00$          

X X X X 5 Ayotte and King for Tile, Inc. $938,480  $                  -    $                 -    $          938,480.00 

X X X X 5 Pavilion Floors, Inc. $1,137,163  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,137,163.00 
May be used by any general 
bidder except: GVW; CJM 
Services

X X X X High Point Interiors $1,189,907  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,189,907.00 

X X X X X Joseph Cohn & Son Tile & Terrazzo, LLC $1,507,690  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,507,690.00 

Capital Carpet & Flooring Specialists, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   

9 Acoustical Ceiling System 1,138,800.00$       
X X X X X H. Carr & Sons, Inc. $1,138,800  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,138,800.00 
X X X X X K&K Acoustical Ceilings, Inc. $1,203,200  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,203,200.00 

X X X X 5 The Cheviot Corporation $1,516,150  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,516,150.00 
May be used by any general 
bidder except: GTC Const. & 
Castagna Const.

X X X X X Central Ceilings, Inc. $1,519,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,519,000.00 
9 Resilient Flooring 678,680.00$          

X X X X X CJM Services, Inc. $678,680  $                  -    $                 -    $          678,680.00  May be used by any general 
bidder except: GVW 

X X X X 5 Pavilion Floors, Inc. $773,407  $                  -    $                 -    $          773,407.00 
 May be used by any general 
bidder except: GVW; CJM 
Services 

X X X X 5 Ayotte and King for Tile, Inc. $784,370  $                  -    $                 -    $          784,370.00 
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X X X X X Capital Carpet & Flooring Specialists, Inc. $833,444  $                  -    $                 -    $          833,444.00 

 May be used by any general 
bidder except: PDS Engineering, 
Labrain Construction, GVW, CJM 
Services, Callahan, Nauset 
Construction, Nelco Worldwide, 
GTC Construction Management 

9 Painting 607,000.00$          
X X X X 5 Homer Contracting, Inc. $607,000  $                  -    $                 -    $          607,000.00 
X X X X X Dandis Contracting, Inc. $654,600  $                  -    $                 -    $          654,600.00 
X X X X X Bello Painting Company, Inc. $674,000  $                  -    $                 -    $          674,000.00 
X X X X 5 King Painting, Inc. $675,000  $                  -    $                 -    $          675,000.00 

John W. Egan Co., Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
Color Concepts, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   

14 Elevators 500,000.00$          ALLOWANCE
Delta Beckwith Elevator Company No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   Awarding Authority to Rebid Elevators
Eagle Elevator No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   

21 Fire Protection 958,000.00$          
X X X X X Covenant Fire Protection $958,000  $                  -    $                 -    $          958,000.00 
X X X X X Johnson Controls Fire Protection $988,423  $                  -    $                 -    $          988,423.00 
X X X X X Carlysle Engineering, Inc. $1,073,600  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,073,600.00 
X X X X X Xcel Fire Protection, Inc. $1,141,900  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,141,900.00 
X X X X 5 Cogswell Sprinkler Company, Inc. $1,252,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       1,252,000.00 

Hampshire Fire Protection No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
22 Plumbing 2,842,000.00$       

X X X X X Grasseschi Plumbing $2,842,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       2,842,000.00  Norfolk County Mechanical Insulation for 
Insulation $173,940 

X X X X X Patrick J. Kennedy & Sons, Inc. $2,913,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       2,913,000.00  Elad for insulation $194,700 
X X X X X N.B. Kenney Company, Inc. $3,084,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,084,000.00  Energy Insulation for insulation $248,000 

X X X X X
Harold Brothers, Mechanical Contractors, 
Inc.

$3,171,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       3,171,000.00  Elad for insulation $194,700 

Araujo Brothers Plumbing No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
23 HVAC 7,847,000.00$       

X X X X X General Mechanical Contractors, Inc. $7,847,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       7,847,000.00 
 Viking Insulation for Insulation $661,000
Zenergy for Automatic Temperature Controls 
$547,000 

X X X X X William F Lynch, Co. $8,050,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       8,050,000.00 

 Viking Insulation for Insulation $661,000
RP O'Connell for Automatic Temperature Controls 
$600,000
Tekon for Testing and Balancing $72,000 

X X X X X Patrick J. Kennedy & Sons, Inc. $8,693,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       8,693,000.00 

 Frazier Sheet Metal for Sheetmetal $2,000,000
Viking Insulation for Insulation $661,000
Zenergy for Automatic Temperature Controls 
$547,000 
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X X X X X N.B. Kenney Company, Inc. $8,698,000  $                  -    $                 -    $       8,698,000.00 

 Frazier Sheet Metal for Sheetmetal $2,000,000
Viking Insulation for Insulation $661,000
RP O'Connell for Automatic Temperature Controls 
$600,000 

Veterans Development Corporation, Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   

JF White Contracting Co. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   
CAM H.V.A.C. & Construction Inc. No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   

26 Electrical 7,984,000.00$       

X X X X X Wayne J. Griffin Electric, Inc. $7,950,000.00  $     22,000.00  $    12,000.00 $7,984,000.00 

Ockers Section 272100 - Data Communications Network 
Equipment for $325,000
Ockers Section 274000 - Audio-Video Communications for 
$1,775,000 
Ockers Section 277000 - Video Distribution System Section 
for $24,000
WJGEI 280000 - Electronic Safety and Security 
B&B Lightning - Lightning Protection for $39,000

X X X X X Annese Electrical Services, Inc. $9,082,000.00  $       8,800.00  $    18,800.00  $       9,109,600.00 

Signet 27 21 00 Data Communications Network Equipment 
$364,250
Pro AV 27 40 00 Audio-Video Communications $1,700,000
Pro AV 27 70 00 Video Distribution System $27,500
Lan-Tel Communications Inc. 28	00 00 Electronic Safety 
and Security 523,230
Annese Electrical Services Inc.

X X X X X LeVangie Electric Company, Inc. $9,114,000.00  $     16,000.00  $    13,000.00  $       9,143,000.00 

 May be used by any general 
bidder except: 
   CTA Construction 

Whalley Computer Associates, Inc. Data Communications 
Network Equipment 272632.
Pro AV Systems Audio-Video Communications 1700000.
Pro AV Systems Video Distribution System 27500.
Johnson Controls/LeVangie Electric Co., Inc. Electronic 
Safety and Security 453681.
B&B Lightning Protection/LeVangie Electric Co., Inc. 
Lightning Protection 39000.

Your Electric Solutions, Inc.  No Bid  $                  -    $                 -    $                        -   

TOTAL FSB TRADE BUDGET $32,942,921 32,976,921.00$       $                                      -   32,976,921.00$     
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